
2025 Production Budgets - UT Ag Econ. 

From Field Crops to Fruit & Vegetables, UT has budgets to 
help plan for likely expenses and potential profits in the 
upcoming production year. To improve the accuracy, users 
are encouraged to use inputs, prices and processes from their 
operations in budget calculations. This can be done by 
downloading and utilizing the Excel version of the budget. To 
access these budgets, click the link below: 

https://tiny.utk.edu/budgets 

The Sunday Short Read 
 

- January 26th, 2025 - 
Matthew Deist — Agriculture Extension Agent 

931.967.2741 or mdeist@utk.edu 

Click below & select January 24th 

https://tiny.utk.edu/MarketHighlights 

• Raising vs. Purchasing Replacement Heifers - W1283 

• The H-2B Visa Program in Tennessee - W1310 

• BMP for Pruning Landscape Trees, Shrubs, & Ground Covers 

- UT Extension is an Equal Opportunity Provider - 

Text codes below to 81010 for updates: 

For livestock/Forage:  @utlivestock 

For Nursery:   @utnursery 

For Row Crops:  @utrowcrops 

 

At 1:00pm on the 2nd Wednesday of every month there will 
be a live interview where a guest and UT specialists discuss 
beef and/or forage-related topics. For more info, click below: 

https://utbeef.tennessee.edu/live-stock/ 

- Timely Extension Publications - 
https://tiny.utk.edu/pub 

SIGN UP NOW - UT Variety Trial & Sentinel Plot 

Interested in testing out new varieties of soybean, corn, or 
cotton? What about having a portion of your field scouted for 
pests on a weekly basis? Sign up for FREE now by contacting 
your local Extension Office. Variety tests are extremely useful 
in testing new varieties (some not commercially available) on 
a local level and though they require a little extra time at 
planting and at harvest, seeing how dozens of different 
varieties perform on your land is extremely valuable. Sentinel 
plots are also extremely beneficial. We flag off roughly 1 acre 
of your crop (typically an annoying corner that’s a pain to get 
to) and ask you not to spray it with insecticide or fungicide 
during the growing season. On a weekly basis, I will scout that 
plot, send leaf and insect samples to our specialists in West 
TN, and monitor crop progress. This is all free of charge, but 
there are only 4 open spots so if interested, call our office 
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